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Last week, the price of sucralose/ acesulfame/aspartame, on the 
other hand, remained stable with normal shipments. Creatine 
monohydrate was driven by market sentiment, the current 
transaction price was at 3.85usd/kg, but the delivery schedule was 
lined up until late December. The price of L-carnitine series was 
stable. Prices of preservative products are stable, and the delivery 
status of each manufacturer is normal.

FOOD ADDITIVE
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Last week, the overall market of veterinary raw materials ran 
smoothly. The market price of the products such as doxycycline, 
florfenicol, oxytetracycline hydrochloride and so on was stable for 
the time being, but the spot was less and the supply was still tight. 
In addition, tilmicosin phosphate still maintains strong trend and 
high market concern. Later on, we will continue to pay attention to 
the market changes.. 

API
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Last week,98% lysine market factory external offer firm, the market 
spot tension, the factory more delivery-based, 70% lysine market 
stability; Threonine: prices are at a high level and stable, end-users 
signing cautious, mostly wait-and-see; Methionine: factory offer 
strong, but the overall demand for the general, the market trend of 
steady strong, need to keep pay attention to the status.

AMINO ACID
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Last week, the vitamin market was stable. Folic acid manufacturers 
still stop offering, some trader has sold some stock, prices are high 
place; VB6 mainstream factories stopped offering, may getting 
higher. In addition, with the increase of foreign pre-Christmas 
purchases, the domestic market users end of the year stocking up, 
the recent week D3 turnover increased significantly, the factory 
and basically to stop reporting, the market inventory continues to 
be consumed to reduce; China's export FOB transaction price of $ 
32-35,  the mainstream factories in the domestic and export is 
basically to stop offering; D3 market price is expected to In 
December there will be a leaping upward trend, may be a new high.
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